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Office of ffie tuLeficaf Superintenfent
Santosfi ltospitat

I

-t

{)--

Date : 12.07,2018
licf. No. :

To'

Ir4r. Ra.ieev Sharma,
Sr. Sales Executive
Trio Tree Technologies pw. Ltd.
C-l l0 on 2,td Floor,-Sector,-Of*'
Noida, District Gautam Budh Nagar (U.p.)(lvl) 09643487293

Enrn il rajeev.shanna@hiotree.com / www.triohee.com

\Yitlr reference to your Estimate No. -Nil- dated I l.o7.2olg,we are hereby pleased to place

the Purchase order for the same with the terms & conditions, as mentioned below:

sl.
No.

Model with Specifiaation Rate Amount

I HISTree License for single site of Santosh Hospital. 35,00,000.00 35,00,000.00
Teaching Hospital Discount 20,00,000.00

15,00,000.00
GST I8% 2,70,000.00

Crand Total including all type of taxes 17,70,000.00

Terms & Conditions:

Sub.

I. The above said Hospital Inforrnation System should be install in our Hospital IT Cell

orenrises on or before . -( -'--------t\ Z. Pavment Schedule.-.^. d
i. I5der'&ii;;lo;, 

"ost 
is payabteon signiri! thG'iigrbemesrl

ii. i39% ons,,,9,g1ppfgJi .'ij-f;fqlqpfiiiqilil",,,w-o-1ffi0ffi and Training commencement

. r'- ./ lComplefe'ioftware installed in a training.environment)
$2 iii. lloTo on tst GotIvE

iv. $ ffiffi.ru$':
v. Bank Details for Payment:

Bank - Kotak Mahindra Bank

Bmnch Add. _ H_llA_16 on Cround Floor, Sector-63, Noida_201307

Cornpany Name Triotree Technologies Private Limited

Accotrrrt No' ' 8711244683

IFSC Code - KKBK0000180
Contd. ....page 2
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3.

4.

5.

" ltu14e2 _

'l"l)S tlerlrrclerl lrn,rcr rrrlcr,.

'l'ltc xtrplrlic'lvlll ltrrrtltllc lirr llt* lr-,lrrin,r'l'lirrf| nt Hnnkt:rlt !kt:,rtirnl r<:ynrdirislrlu:
rrsc & ntllrrlcrrlltt:c ol.thhi riollrvlrc,
\\'irrrrilrlY ruPl)orl.,; lir[ lirr: prurlrrcl rvill [c npplicnlilt: f.trr l?. ntt,.:.th,, [y1171 I,Jrtlect
K ickrrlll

Atr{c rrpplicttbl*v*rtrl bc crrurscr , ,, {o,tiil,lilr',,i"l,,',i ir*,, unu i:, pait! suart*rty in
rdr'$rre c.

r\n1' cttltnnccrttcltl/intcgrnliott rcqucslcd would bu takcu up ar; alrangc fteue1t vthich
rrriglrt lrnvc crrst inrpric,ti.n$ ilt 0 brondcd rutc or.65t)trrt4rl/t,r).

PACS lnlcgration is irrclutJed.

Lrb Equiprncnr Intcgration cosr shalt bc 3SA0ll

i nt erlacc ( U n i d i rcct io nal / Bi - di r ceti rnal r csp ccti v el y ),

(
$.

9. lNIl/45A00 yter equipment

{a

(

Coprlg:
l. Secrctariate, for information
2. Accounts Departmcnts - I-lospital
3. Store IlC.
Undcrtakc bv the SuppJicr:
I hcrcby undertakc to full fill all the conditions listcd abavc.

t touit.ICI. 

- 

/
TrioTree@.
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SARAL Computers Pvt.Ltd.
138, First Floor, Sher Singh Place

G.T.Road, GHAZIABAD-201001
Phone : 9810364941,9990904941

E MAIL: rm@saral.in, saralindia@gmail.com, web-site: www.saralindia.com
PAN No: AACCS6109F, CIN No: U72300DL1996PTC084017, GSTIN No: 09AACCS6109F1ZG

PERFORMA INVOICE

SANTOSH DENTAL COLLEGE
GHAZIABAD
, 

Invoice No: 0037

Date: 15/03/2022

SNo P A R T I C U L A R S        (SAC CODE : 998313) Amount

 1 DENTAL OPD MANAGEMENT SOFTWARE   260000.00

Total Value in Rupees   260000.00
CGST @ 9 %    23400.00
SGST @ 9 %    23400.00
Net Payable   306800.00

Amount in Words - Rupees Three Lakh Six Thousand Eight 
Hundred only.

Bank A/c Details:
      Bankers: BANK OF BARODA
      Branch: Raj Nagar, Ghaziabad.
      A/c Name: SARAL COMPUTERS PVT. LTD.
      A/c No: 21860400000010,  IFSC Code: BARB0RAJNAG
All Disputes are Subject to Ghaziabad Jurisdiction only.
E & OE

For  SARAL Computers Pvt.Ltd.

Authorised Signatory

Regd.Office: A-703, Mayur Dhwaj Apartment, Plot No-60, I.P.Extension, Patparganj, Delhi-92
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Fwd: Regarding Dental OPD ERP Software ONLINE Version
1 message

SARAL SOFTECH <rm@saral.in> Fri, Feb 24, 2023 at 2:20 PM
To: Dr Akshay Bhargava (Professor and Dean Dental) <akshay.bhargava@santosh.ac.in>,
satrughan.sharma@santosh.ac.in

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: SARAL SOFTECH <rm@saral.in>
Date: Tue, Dec 7, 2021 at 11:07 AM
Subject: Regarding Dental OPD ERP Software ONLINE Version
To: Krishna Mohan Singh (IT Head) <KRISHNA.MOHAN@santosh.ac.in>

Dear Mr. Krishna Mohan Ji

This is further in ref. to our meeting held with your good self and HOD sir, regarding Dental OPD
Management ERP for your esteemed organization.

First of all I would like to thank you for the confirmation of your order for the same.

As discussed and agreed:

1. The Software usage rights, training and support fee for the first year will be Rs.2,60,000/-
2. 15% of Rs.2,60,000/- will be charged every year towards software support and training fee.
3. Second year onwards Rs.60,000/- per annum will be charged towards Cloud Server Charges.
4. GST will be charged extra as applicable at the time of billing. as on date it's 18%.

All payments to be made in advance as defined in the terms of quotation.

Request to kindly confirm and let us know when to start the training of your staff and to your assigned
software administrator.

--
Thanks & Regards

Raajesh Malhotra
SARAL Computers Pvt. Ltd.
Phone:, +91 9810364941, +91 9990904941
email: rm@saral.in, saralindia@gmail.com   web-site: www.saralindia.com
skype-id: saral.raajesh
Facebook | LinkedIn | Twitter | Instagram | IndiaMart 

****Application Development (Mobile, Web & Desktop), Web Design & Development | CRM
& ERP for Schools, Colleges, Institutes, Industries| Practice Management Software for
Doctors | eCommerce | Digital & Social Media Marketing | Cloud Server Management |
Domain Registrations SINCE 1990............

This e-mail, including any attachments contains information which is confidential and/or privileged to SARAL Computers
Pvt. Ltd. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify us immediately and destroy this e-mail without taking any
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copies or showing it to anyone. Unauthorized use of this e-mail is prohibited. We take no responsibility for misdirection,
corruption or unauthorized use of e-mail communications, or for any damage that may be caused as a result of
transmitting or receiving an e-mail communication.

--
Thanks & Regards

Raajesh Malhotra
SARAL Computers Pvt. Ltd.
Phone:, +91 9810364941, +91 9990904941
email: rm@saral.in, saralindia@gmail.com   web-site: www.saralindia.com
skype-id: saral.raajesh
Facebook | LinkedIn | Twitter | Instagram | IndiaMart 

****Application Development (Mobile, Web & Desktop), Web Design & Development | CRM
& ERP for Schools, Colleges, Institutes, Industries| Practice Management Software for
Doctors | eCommerce | Digital & Social Media Marketing | Cloud Server Management |
Domain Registrations SINCE 1990............

This e-mail, including any attachments contains information which is confidential and/or privileged to SARAL Computers
Pvt. Ltd. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify us immediately and destroy this e-mail without taking any
copies or showing it to anyone. Unauthorized use of this e-mail is prohibited. We take no responsibility for misdirection,
corruption or unauthorized use of e-mail communications, or for any damage that may be caused as a result of
transmitting or receiving an e-mail communication.
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